:' Bedfordshire, Luton Bedfordshire, Luton

and Milton Keynes and Milton Keynes
® ¢ Health and Care Partnership Integrated Care Board

Freedom of Information Request — Reference: FOI-891

Subject: Continuing Healthcare application made in 2022/23

Response from ICB

1 | The total number of o For Question 1-3 and Question 9 the information is publicly
a. standard applications available at this link

b. fast-track applications - . Statistics » Continuing Healthcare and NHS-funded Nursing
that were made to your ICB for NHS continuing healthcare funding?
Care (england.nhs.uk)

2 | How many of those standard applications were

a. negative (did not meet criteria)

b. positive (did meet criteria) but did not proceed to full
assessment?

3 | How many of the standard applications proceeded to a full assessment

of needs?
4 | Of those that went to full assessment, how many standard applications We do not record specific data around number of Face-to-Face
involved an in person face-to-face meeting with the applicant? assessments. All assessments involve a Face-to-Face meeting but
in exceptional cases these may be done virtually.
5 | Following a full assessment of needs, can you tell me: We do not record specific data around number of Face-to-Face

assessments.
How many applications were assessed as ineligible for NHS continuing
healthcare funding?
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https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.england.nhs.uk%2Fstatistics%2Fstatistical-work-areas%2Fnhs-chc-fnc%2F&data=05%7C02%7Clisa.alvarez%40nhs.net%7C7d303184ff87484a613408dc2986f1a5%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C638430906747401556%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=QVD5MSitWOKeMSZwHFk4vv%2FRwL8RPTPA8OM53MjHQuU%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.england.nhs.uk%2Fstatistics%2Fstatistical-work-areas%2Fnhs-chc-fnc%2F&data=05%7C02%7Clisa.alvarez%40nhs.net%7C7d303184ff87484a613408dc2986f1a5%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C638430906747401556%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=QVD5MSitWOKeMSZwHFk4vv%2FRwL8RPTPA8OM53MjHQuU%3D&reserved=0

a. Of those, how many involved an in person face-to-face
meeting with the applicant?

6 | How many were eligible for NHS continuing healthcare? We do not record specific data around number of Face-to-Face

assessments.

a. Of those, how many involved an in person face-to-face
meeting with the applicant?

7 | Does your ICB always involve specialists in the assessment of the Yes.
specific medical condition that the person being assessed for NHS
continuing healthcare presents with? For example a Parkinson’s nurse,
an MS specialist nurse, a neurologist etc.

8 | What is the minimum level of training NHS continuing healthcare Minimal training for staff is completion of the e-learning course on
assessors undertake to understand needs associated with a range of CHC, plus attendance at CHC training provided by certified NHSE
complex long-term conditions? trained train the trainers

9 | Please can you complete the table below to show how many applications were completed in relation to the different timescales?

Less than 4 weeks 4-8 8-12 12 -26
weeks weeks weeks

Checklists

Full Assessment

Applications for Further Clarification is needed re:
review Applications for Review

The above information is correct at: 12 February 2024
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